



Petersburg City Public Schools
Purchasing Department
 Bid Tabulations - IFB 17-006
 Custodial/Cleaning Supplies
Receipt Date: 8/25/16
Opening Date: 8/25/16

1	Brame	6	Sterile Service
2	Buck-Eye	7	Central Poly
3	Guernsey	8	Eric-Cotton
4	Birsch	9	All American
5	Interboro		

Stock No.	Brame	Buck-Eye	Guernsey	Birsch	Interboro	Sterile Services	Central Poly	Eric-Cotton	All American
5127	16.44	4.53	6.67	2.21	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5133	31.19	3.77	2.68	3.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5136	14.75	11.75	No Bid	11.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5139	1.10	2.04	No Bid	1.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5142	18.36	3.70	No Bid	2.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5154	22.75	2.73	1.50	1.82	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5157	No Bid	No Bid	1.45	1.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5160	76.38	9.20	5.75	8.14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5199	35.00	5.91	2.96	3.79	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5307	No Bid	6.76	No Bid	2.81	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5312	23.24	4.98	2.99	4.46	3.90	No Bid	3.26	No Bid	No Bid
5313	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5328	32.49	23.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	12.77	No Bid	5.95	No Bid
5340	No Bid	6.34	No Bid	3.78	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5358	2.00	0.78	No Bid	1.09	No Bid	0.74	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5370	5.62	4.70	No Bid	3.68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Stock No.	Brame	Buck-Eye	Guernsey	Birsch	Interboro	Sterile Services	Central Poly	Eric-Cotton	All American
5394	5.19	7.08	No Bid	8.01	No Bid	7.62	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5412	2.72	No Bid	2.60	3.31	No Bid	2.76	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5415	No Bid	3.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5430	16.19	2.87	11.76	29.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5437	22.28	21.43	17.93	23.75	No Bid	No Bid	21.66	No Bid	No Bid
5440	No Bid	30.00	No Bid	16.28	No Bid	25.66	13.00	No Bid	No Bid
5442	29.90	20.03	23.37	25.85	No Bid	No Bid	26.90	27.82	No Bid
5454	33.49	38.60	4.00	25.66	No Bid	4.13	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5456	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	17.78	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5458	44.90	8.93	4.65	5.81	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5468	12.45	17.54	17.98	27.00	41.97	22.77	10.10	No Bid	43.76
5472	13.50	13.39	12.39	36.50	30.68	32.43	10.10	No Bid	21.43
Foaming Instand Hand Sanitizer	86.26	61.62	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid



Donna Fields-Duvall
Director of Business and Finance

Note: These results are preliminary only. Award will be made to the firm complying with the terms and conditions of the IFB after review and analysis.